
Annual Membership Dues:  $100 

Please check one of the following 

payment options: 

□ Enclosed is my check made  

payable to WMA for  $_________ 

 

□  Please Charge $_______ to my: 

______ VISA    ______MasterCard 

 

Account#__________________________ 

Expiration Date: _____________ 

Name as it appears on card: 

____________________________________ 
                (Please Print) 

____________________________________________ 
            (Signature Required) 

 

Name _____________________________________ 

Practice ___________________________________ 

Address ___________________________________ 

City _______________________________________ 

State _____________ Zip__________________ 

Tel _________________________________ 

Fax ________________________________ 

Email _______________________________ 
 

Mail to:   

Waterbury Medical Association 

P. O. Box 30, Bloomfield, CT 06002  

One Strong Voice 

For the Physicians of 

Greater Waterbury 
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Why Should I Join the 
Waterbury Medical 
Association? 

 

 Support an organization that is your 

representative in the medical community.  
The members of our Executive Committee 
can communicate effectively on your behalf 
with county and state medical association, 
hospital administrations, government agencies 
and legislators.  While we can’t solve all your 
problems we can amplify your voice and help 
present your views in an effective way, saving 
you time and aggravation. 

 

 Community Service Be a part of an 

organization that gives back to the 
community through its activities involving the 
management of medical school scholarship 
fund, public safety, and Project Access, 
helping to build your image and the image of 
the medical profession in our community. 

 
 Value At $100 the WMA is a bargain. We 

are able to do this because the income from 
our substantial reserves subsidizes a 
significant portion of our budget.  Events are 
frequently discounted to members and guests. 

 
 Network with other physicians.  Effective 

networking is the key to building a thriving 
practice.  The events sponsored by the WMA 
provide an opportunity to get to know other 
members of the medical community outside 
the office and hospital.  Interact with your 
peers and consultants in a more social 
environment. 

Contact Us 

Waterbury Medical Association 

Phone: (203) 753-4888 

Email: myokose@ssmgt.com 

Visit us on the web:  
www.waterburymedicalassociation.org 

What Do We Do? 

Advocate for Physicians 
 
 Host periodic face-to-face meetings with 

legislators 
 

 Maintain a liaison with legislators in 
Hartford 

 

 Maintain a close working relationship with 
the Connecticut State Medical Society and 
the New Haven County Medical 
Association 

 

 Provide personal advice and assistance to 
whatever extent is possible through our 
Physician Advocate Program 

 
 

Host Social and Educational Events 

These often include guest speakers from a 

variety of backgrounds, Waterbury symphony 

events, organized outings such as golf, etc. 

 

Promote the Welfare of the Community 

 Connecticut Safe Kids 

 Project Access 

 Research Day at both hospitals 

 Provide scholarship assistance to area 

medical students through a separate 

endowed fund restricted for that purpose 


